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MUSIC CURRICULUM MAP 

 Autumn Term Spring Term Summer Term 

Year One Hey You! 
 

Understand the musical 
terms pulse, rhythm and 

pitch 

In the Groove 
 

Learn a song in the style of 
Blues, Baroque, Latin, 

Bhangra, Folk and Funk 

Mars 
 

Composition based on the 
motif from Mars. 

Introducing using graphic 
notation 

Year Two Rounds 
 

Performance of three songs 
in the form of rounds 

African 
Drumming 

Copy / perform rhythms in 
one and two parts (Whole 
class instrument tuition) 

Sea Shanties 
 

Performance of 3 sea 
shanties with simple 

accompaniment 

Year Three & 
Four 
Cycle A 

Blackbird 
 

Performance and 
accompaniment of the 
protest song Blackbird! 

Glockenspiel 
 

Performance of simple 
tunes.  Introducing standard 

notation 

Pentatonic Scale 
Practise standard notation, 
learn simple tunes played 

on the pentatonic scale 

Year Three & 
Four Cycle B Mamma Mia! 

 
Performance and 

accompaniment of the pop 
song Mamma Mia! 

Recorder 
 

Performance of simple 
tunes using B-A-G-F-E 
Introducing standard 

notation 

Aquarium 
 

Composition based on 
Aquarium from Carnival of 

the Animals using a 
graphical score 

Year Five & 
Six  
Cycle A 

Livin’ on a 
Prayer 

Performance and 
accompaniment of the rock 

song Livin’ on a Prayer 

Jazz n’ Blues 
 

Improvising using 3 – 5 
notes.  Compose using 

standard notation 

Motown 
Know artists from BAME 

backgrounds.  Performance 
and accompaniment of 
Dancing in the Street 

Year Five & 
Six  
Cycle B 

‘O fortuna’ 
Composition based on the 

motif from O fortuna.  
Notate using standard 

notation. 

Ukuleles 
 

Learn 4 chords and play 
simple popular songs using 

4 chords 

Digital Music 
Production 

Learn to use Yumu and 
Bandlab to create music 


